REIMER DOBROVOLNY & KARLSON LLC

A Public Safety Law Firm

15 Spinning Wheel Road, Suite 310 Hinsdale, IL 60521

(630) 654-9547

Jan 6,2018

Sgt. Bill Gaides, President Orland Hills Police Pension Board 16033 S. 9th Avenue Orland Hills, IL 66487

PLEASE INDICATE CLIENT

2797

23196

Payments Received:

\$904.94

RE: LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED

DUE UPON RECEIPT

The least of the Sa					
DATE	<u>ATY</u>	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
MATTER		2797-001			
RE:	.				
KD.		Quarterly Retainer Agreement			
11/06/15					
11/06/17	MSM	Email regarding adoption of tax levy and municipal compliance report	0.25	\$0.00	\$0.00
11/13/17	MSM	Email to Sgt. Gaides regarding actuarial statement discrepancy	0.25	\$0.00	\$0.00
11/22/17	MSM	Correspondence to Village regarding tax levy	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
11/27/17	MSM	Correspondence to Village Administrator with Municipal Compliance Report	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
11/30/17	RJR	Quarterly Retainer Fee: January - March 2018			\$750.00
		MATTER TOTALS:	1.50		\$750.00
MATTER:		2797-002			
RE:		Disability Application of Michael Pahl			
		•			
11/19/17	RJR	Prepare Hearing Exhibits and Index to Pension Board Hearing Exhibits	1.50	\$175.00	\$262.50
11/22/17	MSM	Email to Board President and Secretary with Notice of Hearing per their request	0.25	\$150.00	\$37.50
	AM	Bates stamp and scan Pension Hearing Exhibits	1.50	\$75.00	\$112.50
	AM	Organized scanned exhibits on server, and revised and printed index. Duplication of six USB flash drives of hearing exhibits	0.75	\$75.00	\$56.25
11/27/17	MSM	Correspondence to Sgt. Gaides and Officer Pahl with Pension Board Hearing Exhibits	1.00	\$150.00	\$150.00

Invoice #:		23196	Page	2	
12/05/17	MSM	Document review and prepare for disability hearing	3.00	\$150.00	\$450.00
12/06/17	MSM	Travel to/from Orland Hills and attend disability hearing	2.25	\$150.00	\$337.50
12/07/17	MSM	Telephone conference with Village Administrator Brian O'Neil regarding pension calculation	0.25	\$150.00	\$37.50
12/12/17	MSM	Correspondence to Assistant Village Manager O'Neil regarding Pahl	0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00
12/18/17	MSM	Telephone conference with President Gaides regarding disability	0.75	\$150.00	\$112.50
	MSM	Email to Village Administrator O'Neil regarding Pahl benefits and payment	0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00
		MATTER TOTALS:	12.25		\$1,706.25
DISBURS	EMENT	<u>S</u>			AMOUNT
MATTER:		2797-001			
RE:		Quarterly Retainer Agreement			
		Photocopy			4.50
		Postage			8.86
		MATTER TOTALS:			\$13.36
MATTER:		2797-002			
RE:		Disability Application of Michael Pahl			
		Photocopy			77.50
Nov-22-17		Flash drives for Pension Board Hearing Exhibits			54.00
Nov-30-17		Index and binding of original Pension Board Hearing Exhibits			20.59
Dec-06-17		Court Reporter and Transcript Fee			416.45
		MATTER TOTALS:			\$568.54
		TOTAL FEES			2 0 0
		TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS			\$2,456.25
					\$581.90
		AMOUNT DUE THIS BILL			\$3,038.15
		PREVIOUS BALANCE			\$0.00
	J	RETAINER AMOUNT APPLIED		N=100000	\$0.00
		TOTAL AMOUNT DUE			\$3,038.15

REIMER DOBROVOLNY & KARLSON LLC

A Public Safety Law Firm

15 Spinning Wheel Road, Suite 310 Hinsdale, IL 60521

(630) 654-9547

Mar 4,2018

Sgt. Bill Gaides, President Orland Hills Police Pension Board 16033 S. 9th Avenue Orland Hills, IL 66487

PLEASE INDICATE CLIENT #

2797

23339

Payments Received:

\$0.00

RE: <u>LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED</u>

DUE UPON RECEIPT

DATE	ATY	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
MATTER:		2797-001			
RE:		Quarterly Retainer Agreement			
01/17/18	MSM	Travel to and attend Quarterly Pension Board Meeting.	2.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
01/18/18	MSM	Email to Bill Gaides regarding Department of Insurance valuation. Telephone conference with Elaine Keller from Department of Insurance regarding same	0.50	\$0.00	\$0.00
		MATTER TOTALS:	3.00		\$0.00
MATTER:		2797-002			4000
RE:		Disability Application of Michael Pahl			
0.1.10.0.11.0					
01/03/18	MSM	Prepare Decision and Order.	4.00	\$150.00	\$600.00
	MSM	Correspondence to William Gaides regarding hearing transcripts	0.50	\$150.00	\$75.00
	MSM	Prepare Certificate of Service and Certificate of Payment. Correspondence to Pension Board regarding instructions for service of Decision and Order.	1.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
		MATTER TOTALS:	5.50		\$825.00
DISBURSEMENTS				AMOUNT	
MATTER:		2797-002			
RE:		Disability Application of Michael Pahl			
		Photocopy			22.75

Invoice	e #: 23339	Page 2
	Postage	2.70
	MATTER TOTALS:	\$25.45
	TOTAL FEES	\$825.00
	TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS	\$25.45
	AMOUNT DUE THIS BILL	\$850.45
	PREVIOUS BALANCE	\$0.00
	RETAINER AMOUNT APPLIED	\$0.00
	TOTAL AMOUNT DUE	\$850.45

RETAINER BALANCE \$0.00

REIMER DOBROVOLNY & KARLSON LLC

A Public Safety Law Firm

15 Spinning Wheel Road, Suite 310 Hinsdale, IL 60521 (630) 654-9547

Mar 26,2018

Sgt. Bill Gaides, President Orland Hills Police Pension Board 16033 S. 9th Avenue Orland Hills, IL 66487

PLEASE INDICATE CLIENT

2797

23547

Payments Received:

\$0.00

RE: LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED

DUE UPON RECEIPT

DATE	<u>ATY</u>	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	RATE	<u>AMOUNT</u>
MATTER:		2797-001			
RE:		Quarterly Retainer Agreement			
02/19/18	MSM	Review engagement letter from Lauterbach & Amen. Review Lauterbach & Amen memorandum to Pension Board	1.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
02/28/18	RJR	Quarterly Retainer Fee April through June 2018			\$750.00
		MATTER TOTALS:	1.00		\$750.00
MATTER:		2797-002			
RE:		Disability Application of Michael Pahl			
02/26/18	MSM	Correspondence to President Gaides regarding Pahl and PSEBA	0.25	\$0.00	\$0.00
		MATTER TOTALS:	0.25		\$0.00
	100	TOTAL FEES			\$750.00
		TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS			\$750.00 \$0.00
				-	Ψ0.00
		AMOUNT DUE THIS BILL			\$750.00
		PREVIOUS BALANCE			\$850.45
		RETAINER AMOUNT APPLIED			\$0.00
		TOTAL AMOUNT DUE			\$1,600.45